
Senate Bill 32 - The Pregnancy Resource Act (a Pro-Life Tax Credit Bill) - Please 
call your SC House Representative and tell them to vote YES for passage S. 32.  Once 
passed, it would provide a SC tax credit to those who contribute to charitable 
organizations that provide adoption services, prevent abuse, neglect, or abandonment; 
prevent trafficking of children and provide assistance related to carrying a pregnancy to 
term, preventing abortion, and promoting healthy childbirth. 
 
--Personhood Day at SC Statehouse - April 23rd 
   12-1 pm - Please join other organizations throughout the state at the SC Statehouse 
at 1100 Gervais Street in Columbia to Rally for Life.  Would there be interest in 
carpooling down and perhaps taking in lunch afterwards? 
 
--The Tennessee Genomic Security and End Organ Harvesting Act, unanimously 
passed earlier by both chambers of TN's legislature, addresses the concerns with 
Beijing’s potential access to Americans’ genomic data collection as well as complicity 
with the regime’s state-sanctioned forced organ harvesting. 
 
 
Tennessee has enacted legislation—effective Jan. 1, 2026—to stop health insurance 
coverage for human organ transplant surgeries linked to China, becoming the fourth 
state to act against the Chinese Communist Party’s (CCP) killing-for-organs 
scheme.  Texas, Utah, and Idaho have previously endorsed similar measures. In 
Congress, bills such as the Stop Forced Organ Harvesting Act, the Falun Gong 
Protection Act, and the BLOCK Act seek to curb systematic abuse in China through 
sanctions and federal reimbursement. 
 
Planned Parenthood & SC Update 
 
--U.S. Supreme Court - In 2018, Gov. McMaster's executive order prevented SC 
taxpayers from paying for abortions. Gov. McMaster stated, "Taxpayer dollars should 
never fund abortion providers like Planned Parenthood. In 2018, I issued an executive 
order to end this practice in South Carolina. I'm confident the U.S. Supreme Court will 
agree with me that states shouldn't be forced to subsidize abortions.  Planned 
Parenthood is trying to get Medicaid dollars paid by taxpayers by calling itself "a 
qualified medical facility".  In order to get this money, they have now gone to the U.S. 
Supreme Court.  Please pray Gov. McMaster's executive order is upheld so that 
Medicaid dollars truly go to "qualified medical facilities".    
 
--SC Supreme Court - Planned Parenthood is trying to change the six-week Heartbeat 
Law (which was based on the cardiac activity of an unborn child at six weeks) to nine-
weeks so they have the opportunity to abort a child sooner -- at 6, 7 or 8 weeks. Their 
arguments were heard before the SC Supreme Court, however, there is no timeline for 
a decision from the court.  Pray that babies' lives will continue to be safeguarded by the 
six-week Heartbeat Law. 
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